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From: Botwinick, Alexandra (HHS/OCIIO)
Sent: Monday, December 13, 2010 9:04 AM
To: 'Martin Keane'
Cc: 'mdebartolome@crossroadshc.com'; 'jdigangi@crossroadshc.com'; 'imi229@aol.com'
Subject: Waiver of the Annual Limits Requirements of PHS Act Section 2711

Attachments: Updated Jan 1 Approval Letter .pdf
Good Morning,
 
Thank you for submitting an application for a Waiver of the Annual Limits Requirements of the PHS Act
Section 2711 for Allied Welfare Fund.  HHS has reviewed your application and made its determination. Please
see the attached letter.
 
Please confirm receipt of this letter by replying to this e-mail address with a copy to OCIIOOversight@hhs.gov.
 
Please let me know if I can be of further assistance.
 
Sincerely,
 
 
Alexandra Botwinick
 
Office of Oversight
HHS/OCIIO
alexandra.botwinick@hhs.gov
 
 

 

From: Martin Keane [mailto:keane.martinjk@gmail.com] 
Sent: Friday, December 10, 2010 12:48 PM
To: Botwinick, Alexandra (HHS/OCIIO)
Cc: mdebartolome@crossroadshc.com; jdigangi@crossroadshc.com; imi229@aol.com
Subject: Allied Welfare Fund Fed ID 22-6062974 Application for Waiver of Annual Limits
 
Dear Ms. Botwinick,

       I am a trustee for the Allied Welfare Plan. I am writing concerning our application for a waiver of annual limits
which we filed with HHS on November 7th. Has our waiver been granted? Please let me know at your earliest
convenience.

Thank you.

Martin Keane
Trustee
631-335-0611
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From: Martin Keane [keane.martinjk@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, December 13, 2010 1:11 PM
To: Botwinick, Alexandra (HHS/OCIIO)
Cc: OCIIO Oversight
Subject: Re: Waiver of the Annual Limits Requirements of PHS Act Section 2711

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Red
Dear Ms. Botwinick,

                   This e-mail conforms our receipt of your Departments response to our Waiver request. Thank you for your
help in this matter. Please feel free to contact me if you need additional information about our fund.

Sincerely,

Martin J Keane
Trustee

On Mon, Dec 13, 2010 at 9:03 AM, Botwinick, Alexandra (HHS/OCIIO) <Alexandra.Botwinick@hhs.gov> wrote:

Good Morning,

 

Thank you for submitting an application for a Waiver of the Annual Limits Requirements of the PHS Act
Section 2711 for Allied Welfare Fund.  HHS has reviewed your application and made its determination.
Please see the attached letter.

 

Please confirm receipt of this letter by replying to this e-mail address with a copy to
OCIIOOversight@hhs.gov.

 

Please let me know if I can be of further assistance.

 

Sincerely,

 

 

Alexandra Botwinick

 

Office of Oversight
AWF:000005
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HHS/OCIIO

alexandra.botwinick@hhs.gov

 

 

 

From: Martin Keane [mailto:keane.martinjk@gmail.com] 
Sent: Friday, December 10, 2010 12:48 PM
To: Botwinick, Alexandra (HHS/OCIIO)
Cc: mdebartolome@crossroadshc.com; jdigangi@crossroadshc.com; imi229@aol.com
Subject: Allied Welfare Fund Fed ID 22-6062974 Application for Waiver of Annual Limits

 

Dear Ms. Botwinick,

       I am a trustee for the Allied Welfare Plan. I am writing concerning our application for a waiver of annual limits
which we filed with HHS on November 7th. Has our waiver been granted? Please let me know at your earliest
convenience.

Thank you.

Martin Keane
Trustee
631-335-0611
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